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Editorial 

Cerebral palsy is a group of disorders that cause 
developmental disabilities that result in considerable 
functional limitations. It affects a child’s ability to move 
and maintain balance and posture [1]. Cerebral palsy is 
the most common physical disability in childhood that 
occurs in 1 in 500 live births. 2’3 CP cases are so frequent 
in daily routine work in primary health care with 
emotional and devastating effect on family and their 
health provider as the child may suffer from spasticity, 
uncontrolled movements, intellectual disability, seizures, 
and problems with vision, hearing, or speech. 

 
Early diagnosis will provide better outcome by 

optimizing neuroplasticity and function [2]. This requires 
more attention in routine child visit and creation of new 
programs in primary health care for early detection and 
follows up. The Middle East, including Iraq, needs more 
consideration for CP cases as the clinicians need to listen 
to the mothers about their experiences and obstacles in 
raising a child with CP, providing them suitable solutions. 
Family-centered care needs to be a cornerstone of 
rehabilitation services and enabling the health care 
practitioners to use the family-centered model when 
working with cerebral palsy children [3,4]. 

 
Although hypoxia or ischemia at birth is forming a 

small percent of CP causes according to recent studies, it 
is still somewhat a preventable cause [5]. The role of 
primary health care in this point is represented by 
antenatal care follow up, health education of mothers 
about safe labor and the strict supervision of midwives. 

 

Unfortunately, untrained and non-certified midwives 
are so common in Iraq. It is so frequent to see a pregnant 
with obstructed labor or pelvic disproportion forced to 
have normal labor by a midwife with devastating 
consequences to mother and baby. Strict rules should be 
legislated with continuous training of certified midwives, 
in addition to health lectures to women and midwives. 
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